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ENTERPRISE ARCHITECTURE
AND BUSINESS
TRANSFORMATION
Admission Requirements
Applicants apply for admission to the program via the Graduate School
application for admission (https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-
admissions/how-to-apply/). Requirements listed here are in addition to
Graduate Council policies listed under GCAC-300 Admissions Policies
(https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/).

Since the program is multidisciplinary in nature, students from many
disciplines may be acceptable for entry into the program. The most
qualified applicants will be accepted in the program until all available
spaces for new students are filled.

Consideration for admission into the program will be granted to
individuals who meet one of the following sets of criteria:

• An approved baccalaureate degree with a minimum grade point
average of 2.75 or above, (on a 4.0 scale) a minimum of five years of
relevant work experience, three letters of reference, and a personal
statement of relevant experience and goals.

• An approved baccalaureate degree with a minimum of a 3.00 (on a
4.00 scale) grade point average, a minimum of two years of relevant
work experience, three letters of reference, and a 1-3 page personal
statement of relevant experience and goals.

• A graduate degree, a minimum of one year of relevant work
experience, three letters of reference, and a 1-3 page personal
statement of relevant experience and goals.

• An approved baccalaureate degree, successful completion of three
courses in the program with a minimum of a 3.50 (on a 4.00 scale)
grade point average as a non-degree graduate student, at least two
years of relevant work experience, and a 1-3 page personal statement
of relevant experience and goals.

The language of instruction at Penn State is English. English proficiency
test scores (TOEFL/IELTS) may be required for international applicants.
See GCAC-305 Admission Requirements for International Students
(https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/gcac/
gcac-300/gcac-305-admission-requirements-international-students/) for
more information.
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