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GEOSCIENCES
Admission Requirements
Applicants apply for admission to the program via the Graduate School
application for admission (https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-
admissions/how-to-apply/). Requirements listed here are in addition to
Graduate Council policies listed under GCAC-300 Admissions Policies
(https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/).

Scores from the Graduate Record Examinations (GRE) are not required for
admission.

For admission, applicants generally are expected to have a bachelor's
degree in some branch of the natural or physical sciences, engineering,
or mathematics. An applicant also is expected to have completed
standard introductory courses in geosciences, chemistry, physics, and
mathematics through integral calculus, plus 15 credits of intermediate-
level work in one or a combination of these subjects. Greater than
minimal preparation in chemistry, geology, biology, mathematics, or
physics may be required for particular subdisciplines. Applicants who
have taken somewhat less than the indicated minimum in these subjects
may be provisionally admitted (http://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-
education-policies/gcac/gcac-300/gcac-303-provisional-admission/)
but must make up their deficiencies concurrently with their graduate
studies. Credits for these preparatory courses will not count towards
degree requirements.

Students with special backgrounds, abilities, and interests whose
undergraduate grade-point average in courses pertinent to geosciences is
below a 3.00 (on a 4.00 scale) will be considered for admission only when
there are strong indications that a 3.00 average can be maintained at the
graduate level.

A student may work toward a Ph.D. degree without first earning a
master's degree. If this option is desired, the student must arrange the
scheduling of a qualifying evaluation no later than the end of the third
semester of residence at Penn State.

https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-admissions/how-to-apply/
https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-admissions/how-to-apply/
https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-admissions/how-to-apply/
https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-admissions/how-to-apply/
https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/
https://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/
http://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/gcac/gcac-300/gcac-303-provisional-admission/
http://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/gcac/gcac-300/gcac-303-provisional-admission/
http://gradschool.psu.edu/graduate-education-policies/gcac/gcac-300/gcac-303-provisional-admission/

